
Statement of Purpose 
 
 
Introduction:- 

 
I would like to introduce myself as Atul Sharma, from Chandigarh , India native. Regarding 
my academic background, I graduated from the Central Board of secondary Education in 2015 
with a secondary education and from the same board in 2017 with a senior secondary 
education. I then completed my Bachelors at Punjab University in 2020 and then I completed 
Masters in 2022 . To achieve a better career option in my home country I decided to get a 
international degree from the United States. since it is a top destination for higher education 
globally. 
 
Why I choose USA:- 

 
The United States of America is an amazing country that is well-known for its excellent 
educational and scientific systems. Most international students opt to complete their 
postsecondary studies at American universities. The system of education is flexible and 
dynamic. US universities provide excellent programs across all subject areas, and they have an 
extremely astounding selection of degrees to choose from. Students also have the chance to 
collaborate with and pick up knowledge from highly accomplished and competent researchers 
in the subject. It also gives practical abilities and work-related activities more weight. 
Universities not only set the standard in science and technology but also offer a plethora of 
recreational, cultural, and educational possibilities that help students form relationships and 
develop a sense of global citizenship. 
. 

Why This University:- 
 
I've done a lot of research and have come to the conclusion that Golden Gate University in the 
US is my ideal university. Golden Gate University (GGU) seems to be a respectable 
institution that provides excellent practice-based learning in a demanding, cutting-edge 
setting. After looking into courses and colleges, Golden Gate University emerged as the top 
choice. The smaller class sizes here than at other universities are what initially drew me in, as 
they promote better learning and student-teacher connection. I think students will have an 
easier time understanding how statistics are used in different businesses if research programs 
and case studies are incorporated into the curriculum. Furthermore, the university offers a 
plethora of networking opportunities with regional, national, and worldwide organizations. 
The multicultural community on campus is seen by students as friendly and inviting.  I think 
that learning in this setting will benefit me in more ways than just enhancing my abilities and 
making me a professional expert. 
 
 
Why MBA Business Analytics Course:- 

 
I want to get an MBA with Business analytics because it's a popular degree in the present era. 
It can raise one's professional marketability and increase both the number and quality of job 
openings. Gaining a comprehensive understanding of essential management disciplines with 
an MBA is beneficial for a variety of sectors and job types. Broadens the scope and expands 
the prospects for career advancement. Furthermore, obtaining an MBA may facilitate the 
development of your professional network and corporate leadership abilities. It will build a 
professional network and bolster managerial, leadership, and business skills. It can also 
increase confidence by giving you the chance to manage team projects, take measured chances 
in a safe environment, and get quick feedback. It will also provide me with a thorough 



understanding of management concepts and provide me insight into actual company 
scenarios. Thus, I believe it will help me both professionally and emotionally. 
 
Future Scope:- 

 
I will return to my own country after earning my degree in the United States because I have 
strong ties to my family there. In addition, I intend to work for a highly reputable company 
with a very generous benefits package. It will support my endeavours to become a prosperous 
professional. seeking a degree from Golden Gate University in the United States in order to 
improve my abilities in brand and company development. 
 

 
 
Regards  
Atul Sharma 


